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A man who has delivered sermons on every continent, Dr. William Augustus Jones is a superlative preacher
and has been cited as ""The Dean of New York's Great Preachers"" by the New York Daily News.

The son and grandson of Baptist ministers, Dr. Jones graduated from the University of Kentucky and Crozer
Theological Seminary, and earned a doctoral degree from Colgate Rochester Divinity School. He has done
special studies at the University of Lagos (Nigeria) and the University of Ghana at Legon. He has served as
pastor of Bethany Baptist Church in Brooklyn, New York since September 1962 and led his congregation in
the construction of a Neo-Gothic edifice completed in October 1967. Bethany conducts a multi-faceted
program with a full-time staff of 27 persons. Included in the outreach ministries is a national radio and
television ministry.

Among the many honors he has received is the New York Urban League's prestigious Frederick Douglass
Award. He holds honorary doctorates from Benedict College, Simmons University, Shaw University, and
Campbell University. He received an honorary Doctor of Humanities Degree from his alma mater, the
University of Kentucky. Recently he was awarded the Doctor of Literature Degree by Evangelical Reformed
School of Theology, Toledo. Ohio.

William Augustus Jones, Jr., is in great demand as a preacher throughout America. He has served as
visiting professor at Colgate Rochester Divinity School, Wesley Theological Seminary, Princeton
Theological Seminary, Union Theological Seminary, and United Theological Seminary. He is the author of
several books.
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From reader reviews:

David Anthony:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content.
To be sure that book is very important for people. The book When God Says, "Let Me Alone"; First Lesson
Sermons for Sundays After Pentecost (Sermon Prep Resource for Windows) has been making you to know
about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The
reserve When God Says, "Let Me Alone"; First Lesson Sermons for Sundays After Pentecost (Sermon Prep
Resource for Windows) is not only giving you far more new information but also being your friend when
you truly feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship using the
book When God Says, "Let Me Alone"; First Lesson Sermons for Sundays After Pentecost (Sermon Prep
Resource for Windows). You never really feel lose out for everything when you read some books.

Melissa Conner:

The book with title When God Says, "Let Me Alone"; First Lesson Sermons for Sundays After Pentecost
(Sermon Prep Resource for Windows) has a lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of
help after read this book. This specific book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this guide
represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement
of the world. This particular book will bring you with new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-
book on your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Aurelio Ashley:

Is it anyone who having spare time and then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This When God Says, "Let Me Alone"; First
Lesson Sermons for Sundays After Pentecost (Sermon Prep Resource for Windows) can be the response, oh
how comes? A fresh book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your spare time by reading in
this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Eileen Vaughan:

As a university student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the
library as well as to make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just little students that has
reading's soul or real their passion. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to
there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we
know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this When God Says, "Let Me Alone"; First Lesson Sermons for Sundays After
Pentecost (Sermon Prep Resource for Windows) can make you sense more interested to read.
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