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Ellie's Story is a heartwarming illustrated novel adapted for young readers from the beloved and New York
Times bestselling A Dog's Purpose by W. Bruce Cameron.

Ellie is a very special dog with a very important purpose. From puppyhood, Ellie has been trained as a
search-and-rescue dog. She can track down a lost child in a forest or an injured victim under a fallen
building. She finds people. She saves them. It's what she was meant to do.

But Ellie must do more. Her handlers—widowed Jakob, lonely Maya—need her too. People can be lost in
many ways, and to do the job she was born to do, Ellie needs to find a way to save the people she loves best.

Ellie's Story is an inspiring tale for young animal lovers. Adorable black-and-white illustrations by Richard
Cowdrey bring Ellie and her world to life. A discussion and activity guide at the end of the book will help
promote family and classroom discussions about Ellie's Story and the insights it provides about humankind's
best friends.

At the Publisher's request, this title is being sold without Digital Rights Management Software (DRM)
applied.
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From reader reviews:

Carrie Freeman:

The knowledge that you get from Ellie's Story: A Dog's Purpose Novel is the more deep you searching the
information that hide into the words the more you get serious about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book
is hard to know but Ellie's Story: A Dog's Purpose Novel giving you buzz feeling of reading. The copy writer
conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood simply by anyone who read the item because
the author of this publication is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your vocabulary
increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available.
We advise you for having that Ellie's Story: A Dog's Purpose Novel instantly.

Peggy Gillman:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their free time with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, gonna beach, or
picnic inside the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something
different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book may be option to fill your no cost
time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to
try look for book, may be the publication untitled Ellie's Story: A Dog's Purpose Novel can be very good
book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Carolyn Rodriguez:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always try to and must have the free time or they will get great deal of
stress from both lifestyle and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely
without a doubt. People is human not just a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you have
when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do you try this one,
reading books. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the actual book you have read will
be Ellie's Story: A Dog's Purpose Novel.

Lauren Miner:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, short story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not attempting Ellie's Story: A Dog's Purpose
Novel that give your fun preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading addiction all over
the world can be said as the method for people to know world better then how they react when it comes to
the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man or woman but for all
of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for every you who want to start examining as your
good habit, you are able to pick Ellie's Story: A Dog's Purpose Novel become your own personal starter.
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